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BID SUMMARY

BID TITLE Tires for the County of El Paso

BID NUMBER 20-006

DEPARTMENT  Fleet Operations CONTACT  Hopeton Staple
DESCRIPTION DATE
APPROVAL BY COMMISSIONER'S COURT
PR APPROVED SPECIFICATIONS 10/24/2019
RECEIVED SPECIFICATIONS FROM DEPARTMENT 10/30/2019
BID PACKAGES MAILED 11/12/2019

BID ADVERTISED

PRE-BID CONFERENCE

11/10/2019 & 11/17/2019

DEADLINE TO QUESTIONS 11/21/2019
OPENING DATE 12/65/2619-12/12/2019
SPREADSHEET SENT TO DEPARTMENT 1/14/2020
SPREADSHEET RECEIVED FROM DEPARTMENT 2/3/2020
PR APPROVED AWARD RECOMMENDATION 6/17/2020
PLACED ON COMMISSIONER’S COURT AGENDA 6/29/2020
ADDENDUMS

DATE REASON

11/18/2019 Provide vendors with a revised price sheet.

11/21/2019 Questions & Answers

12/04/2019 Opening Date Extension

COMMENTS:

7 total responses received: American Tire Distributors, Fort Worth, TX; Border Parts
Group dba NAPA, El Paso, TX; Border Recapping LLC, El Paso, TX; Broadway Motors, El
Paso, TX; The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company, Akron, OH; Southern Tire Mart LLC,

Columbia, MS; Tire Connection, El Paso, TX




i
Bid 20-006

Tires for the County of El Paso
Opening Date: Thursday December 12, 2019

American Tire Distributors Border Parts Group, Inc. Bopier Recanlnn LG, Broadviay Motors Thie ooty eArTies8 Rubber Southern Tire Mart, LLC Tire Connection
Fort Worth, TX dba NAPA A onler e dba Bill Williams Tires Lompany Columbia, S El Paso, TX
' El Paso, TX ElPaso, TX El Paso, TX Akron, OH ' ’
Unit Price Manufacture | Unit Price Manufacture Unit Price Manufacture Unit Price Manufacture Unit Price Manufacture Unit Price Manufacture Unit Price Manufacture
Group 1: Automobile

1 185/65R 14 $53.67 GENERAL $61.04 COOPER $48.01 HANDKOOK $60.73 FIRESTONE $49.56 GOODYEAR $62.00 FIRESTONE $47.00 HERCULES
2 195/60R15 $60.10 GENERAL $68.89 COOPER $59.25 BF GOODRICH $66.04 FIRESTONE $49.00 GOODYEAR $57.00 FIRESTONE $49.75 HERCULES
3 205/65R15 $63.82 GENERAL $74.93 COOPER $63.20 BF GOODRICH $68.72 FIRESTONE $56.64 GOODYEAR $62.00 FIRESTONE $50.00 HERCULES
4 215{T5R15 §63.21 IRONMAN §70.25 COOPER $61.85 HANDKOOK $77.64 COOPER $67.27 GOODYEAR $85.00 FIRESTONE $63.40 HERCULES
5 LT235/75R15 $99.43 GENERAL $125.18 COOPER §113.07 HANDKOOK $137.36 COQPER §128.49 GOODYEAR $117.00 FIRESTONE $105.60 HERCULES
6 P205/65R15 §63.82 GENERAL NOBID NO BID $62.02 HANDKOOK $68.72 FIRESTONE §72.45 GOODYEAR $62.00 FIRESTONE $58.48 HERCULES
7 ST225/75R15/10 §73.41 STC NO BID NO BID $69.08 NATIONAL $73.74 SUPER CARGO $104.00 GOODYEAR $61.00 DYNATRAIL $75.25 HERCULES
8 205/60R16 s72.72 GENERAL $85.30 COOPER $68.32 HANDKOOK $65.21 FIRESTONE $65.85 GOODYEAR §73.00 FIRESTONE $61.25 HERCULES
9 215/60R16 $76.92 GENERAL $85.28 COOPER $73.47 BF GOODRICH $79.80 FIRESTONE §65.85 GOODYEAR $81.00 FIRESTONE $63.40 HERCULES
10 LT225/75R16/10 $98.91 GENERAL §132.88 COOPER §123.63 HANDKOOK §118.89 FIRESTONE 511598 GOODYEAR $115.00 FIRESTONE 5101.80 HERCULES
1 LT235/8516/10 §112.30 GENERAL $143.16 COOPER $127.19 BF GOODRICH $124.75 FIRESTONE $131.67 GOODYEAR $118.00 FIRESTONE $115.64 HERCULES
12 LT245/75R16 $106.86 GENERAL NO BID NOBID §127.19 BF GOODRICH §114.50 FIRESTONE $120.00 GOODYEAR $111.00 FIRESTONE $97.50 HERCULES
13 LT245/75R16/10 $106.86 GENERAL $146.44 COOPER §127.19 BF GOODRICH §114.50 FIRESTONE $127.67 GOODYEAR $111.00 FIRESTONE $100.80 HERCULES
14 LT265/75R16 $121.94 GENERAL $154.30 COOPER $137.46 BF GOODRICH $143.97 FIRESTONE $139.00 GOODYEAR $130.00 FIRESTONE $107.85 HERCULES
15 P225/60R16 $77.42 GENERAL $91.83 COOPER §72.25 HANDKOOK $80.34 FIRESTONE $63.00 GOODYEAR §77.00 FIRESTONE $62.45 HERCULES
16 P235/70R16 $86.81 GENERAL $106.37 COOPER §94.01 BF GOODRICH $99.93 FIRESTONE $§74.35 GOODYEAR $97.00 FIRESTONE §79.80 HERCULES
17 P235/70R16 $86.81 GENERAL $106.37 COOPER $94.01 BF GOODRICH $99.93 FIRESTONE $93.81 GOODYEAR $97.00 FIRESTONE $79.80 HERCULES
18 ST235/80R16 $88.52 STC $147.63 GOODYEAR $71.14 NATIONAL $88.60 SPECIALTY TIRE $135.21 GOODYEAR $59.00 TASKMASTER $104.45 HERCULES
19 21575175 $123.69 DYNATRAC $435.97 MICHELIN §175.24 HANDKOOK $199.58 COOPER $215.00 GOOCDYEAR §231.00 BRIDGESTONE §148.10 HERCULES
20 215/60R17 $88.06 GENERAL $105.07 COOPER §82.98 HANDKOOK §119.41 FIRESTONE $74.35 GOODYEAR $90.00 FIRESTONE $84.05 BF GOODRICH
21 235(70R17 $106.11 GENERAL NOBID NOBID $118.53 HANDKOOK 5108.89 FIRESTONE $119.50 GOODYEAR $106.00 FIRESTONE $119.45 HERCULES
22 235(75R17 §118.23 GENERAL NO BID NO BID $130.95 MICHELIN NOBID NOBID §128.06 GOODYEAR $117.00 FIRESTONE $132.80 COOPER
23 LT235/80R17 $116.11 GENERAL $165.63 COOPER $148.52 BF GOODRICH s128.27 FIRESTONE $145.65 GOODYEAR $123.00 FIRESTONE $136.00 HERCULES
24 LT245{70R17 st GENERAL $161.64 COOPER $135.00 BF GOODRICH $125.97 FIRESTONE $131.41 GOODYEAR $122.00 FIRESTONE $103.10 HERCULES
25 LT245/75R17110 §121.25 GENERAL $166.06 COOPER $153.26 BF GOODRICH $129.64 FIRESTONE $130.00 GOODYEAR $125.00 FIRESTONE $124.85 HERCULES
26 LT245(75R17/E $121.25 GENERAL $166.06 COOPER $153.26 BF GOODRICH $129.64 FIRESTONE $141.85 GOODYEAR §125.00 FIRESTONE $124.85 HERCULES
27 255/70R17 11279 GENERAL $165.23 BFG $177.75 BF GOODRICH $118.59 FIRESTONE $136.58 GOODYEAR $116.00 FIRESTONE $127.80 HERCULES
28 LT265/70R17110 $131.31 GENERAL $173.80 COOPER $160.77 HANDKOOK $142.88 FIRESTONE $135.00 GOODYEAR $139.00 FIRESTONE $134.40 HERCULES
29 P225/55R17 $93.50 GENERAL $113.59 COOPER $86.26 UNIROYAL $86.31 FIRESTONE $80.00 GOODYEAR $92.00 FIRESTONE §75.10 HERCULES
30 225/65R17 $91.89 GENERAL $108.71 COOPER $91.39 UNIROYAL $88.24 FIRESTONE §76.00 GOODYEAR §85.00 FIRESTONE $82.40 HERCULES
k1| P235/75R17 $115.76 GENERAL NO BID NOBID $130.85 MICHELIN $149.53 COOPER $134.52 GOODYEAR $112.00 FIRESTONE $137.40 COOPER




Bid 20-006
Tires for the County of El Paso
Opening Date: Thursday December 12, 2019

American Tire Distributors |  Border Parts Group, Inc. Rarder Recappln LLC. Broadviay Motors Thia:Ggodyesr-Tire & Rubber Southern Tire Mart, LLC Tire Connection
Fort Worth, TX dba NAPA dba Bordr Tire dba Bill Williams Tires Company Columbia. MS Ef Paso, TX
' El Paso, TX El Paso, TX El Paso, TX Akron, OH ' '
Unit Price Manufacture | Unit Price Manufacture | Unit Price Manufacture Unit Price Manufacture Unit Price Manufacture Unit Price Manufaclure Unit Price Manufaclure
32 P255/70R17 §112.79 GENERAL §148.58 COOPER §133.78 HANDKODK $118.59 FIRESTONE §125.18 GOODYEAR $116.00 FIRESTONE $127.00 HERGULES
3 P2B5/70R17 $110.07 GENERAL | $138.15 COOPER $125.32 HANDKOOK $117.36 FIRESTONE §135.00 GOODYEAR | §118.00 | FIRESTONE $99.95 HERCULES
34 P255/65R17 §116.75 GENERAL NOBID NOBID NO BID NO BID $100.87 FIRESTONE NOBID GOODYEAR $110.00 FIRESTONE NOBID NOBID
35 P275/B5R18 §128.37 GENERAL §160.20 COOPER $160.05 HANDKOOK $129.77 FIRESTONE §172.23 GOODYEAR $127.00 FIRESTONE $14980 | BF GOODRICH
36 225[T0R19.5 §154.36 IRONMAN 528124 BFG $200.00 UNIROYAL $231.00 BF GOODRICH $225.00 GOODYEAR $262.00 FIRESTONE §179.90 HERCULES
37 P275/55R20 $127.88 GENERAL $143.01 COOPER $136.72 HANDKOOK $123.00 FIRESTONE $118.04 GOCDYEAR §121.00 FIRESTONE $124.80 UNIROYAL
Group 2: OIf Road Tires-Heavy Duly Tires

1 7.50-15/14 NOBID NOBID NOBID NO BID $121.00 POWER KING $137.75 SPECIALTY TIRE NO BID NOBID §125.00 AG DURA $149.00 CARLISLE
2 11R22.5/16 $327.00 FIRESTONE NOBID NOBID $275.00 BF GOODRICH $280.00 BF GOODRICH $260.00 GOODYEAR $265.00 YOKOHAMA $297.85 UNIROYAL
3 11R24.5/16 $355.44 FIRESTONE NOBID NOBID $338.15 BF GOODRICH $338.40 BF GOODRICH $260.00 GOODYEAR $275.00 YOKOHAMA §319.78 UNIROYAL
4 14.00-24/12 $514.80 FIRESTONE NO BID NO BID $369.13 POWER KING §508.15 TITAN $425.00 GOODYEAR $520.00 FIRESTONE $529.90 HERCULES
5 245[15R122.5 $315.00 BIDGESTONE NOBID NOBID $241.50 SUMITOMO $346.00 TOYO §350.00 GOODYEAR $315.00 BRIDGESTONE §297.45 TOYO

6 13.00-24TG 16 PLY $§445.50 FIRESTONE NOBID NOBID $508.00 HERCULES $419.00 BKT §420.00 GOODYEAR $450.00 FIRESTONE §457.45 CARLISLE
7 11.00-20NHS NOBID NOBID NO BID NOBID NOBID NOBID $390.00 DEESTONE NO BID NOBID §580.00 BRIDGESTONE $580.00 BKT

8 FRS G2 RB SGG NOBID NOBID NO BID NOBID NOBID NOBID $§563.25 FIRESTONE NOBID NOBID $450.00 FIRESTONE NOBID NO BID

9 14.00-24/12 $514.80 FIRESTONE NO BID NOBID $508.00 HERCULES $508.15 TITAN $425.00 GOODYEAR $520.00 FIRESTONE $640.00 HERCULES
10 BWG4RBOT NOBID NO BID NO BID NOBID NOBID NOBID $951.77 FIRESTONE NOBID NO BID $817.00 FIRESTONE NOBID NOBID
" 13.6-24/8 $310.13 FIRESTONE NO BID NO BID §308.91 FIRESTONE §302.50 BKT NOBID NO BID $310.00 FIRESTONE $340.80 FIRESTONE
12 16.9-34/6 NOBID NOBID NO BID NOBID §445.97 SAMPSON $985.00 FIRESTONE NOBID NOBID §425.00 CARLISLE $560.55 CARLISLE
13 17.6-25112 §569.25 FIRESTONE NO BID NOBID §454.00 POWER KING §563.00 BKT $625.00 GOODYEAR §575.00 FIRESTONE $702.00 HERCULES
14 17.5-25/16 §630.56 FIRESTONE NO BID NOBID §489.00 POWER KING $626.00 BKT $700.00 GOODYEAR §636.00 FIRESTONE $581.00 SAMSON
15 18X8.50-8/4 $41.80 CARLISLE NOBID NOBID $32.00 POWER KING §75.00 BKT NOBID NOBID $2600 | OTRENGINEER $43.00 CARLISLE
16 20.5-25120 $1,118.71 FIRESTONE NO BID NOBID §630.00 POWER KING §2,824.44 TITANLS $1,463.00 GOODYEAR $1,130.00 FIRESTONE $1,368.00 ARMOUR
17 305/70D016.5/10 §132.30 FIRESTONE NO BID NOBID $340.00 FIRESTONE §282.00 FIRESTONE NOBID NOBID $154.00 FIRESTONE $169.00 HERCULES
18 7.50-1414TT NOBID NOBID NO BID NOBID §169.00 SOLAIR $86.25 SPECIALTY TIRE NO BID NOBID §40.00 TASK MASTER NOBID NOBID
19 10.00-16/8tt 12 3 rib §150.15 FIRESTONE NO BID NOBID §138.00 HARVEST KING $150,15 FIRESTONE NOBID NOBID $161.00 FIRESTONE _ NOBID NO BID
20 11L-15/10 $113.96 FIRESTONE NO BID NOBID $106.00 | HARVESTKING $153.00 BKT $151.00 TITANTIRE $113.00 FIRESTONE $138.58 HERCULES
21 11L-16/10 $130.00 FIRESTONE NO BID NOBID $139.00 HERCULES $§130.00 BKT $159.00 TITAN TIRE $130.00 FIRESTONE $138.58 HERCULES
22 18%9.50x8 §39.87 CARLISLE NO BID NOBID §33.00 NAN KANG §60.00 BKT NOBID NOBID $25.00 OTR ENGINEER $49.00 CARLISLE




. Bid 20-006
Tires for the County of El Paso
Opening Date: Thursday December 12, 2019

American Tire Distributors Border Parts Group, Inc. En”;:f;::ﬁ:_ I:ﬂ:w’ Bro_adw_ay Moinr's The Goudéz:: Tice & Rubiber Southern Tire Mari, LLC Tire Conneclion
Fort Worth, TX dba NAPA dia Bill Williams Tires pany Columbia, MS ElPaso, TX
El Paso, TX Bl Paso, TX El Paso, TX Aliron, OH ' '
Unit Price Manufacture Unit Price Manufaclure Unit Price Manufacture Unit Price Manufacture Unit Price Manufacture Unit Price Manufaclure Unit Price Manufacture
Group 3: Trucks / Vans | Buses
1 LT265/75R16 $121.94 GENERAL NO BID NOBID $137.36 BF GOODRICH $137.75 FIRESTONE $139.00 GOODYEAR $130.00 FIRESTONE $107.85 HERCULES
2 ST225/75R15/10 §75.98 STC NO BID NOBID §75.00 NATIONAL §73.74 SPECIALTY TIRE $104.00 GOODYEAR $61.00 DYNATRAIL $78.80 HERCULES
3 LT225/75R16/10 $107.07 GENERAL NOBID NOBID $123.63 NATIONAL $118.89 FIRESTONE $134.62 GOODYEAR $115.00 FIRESTONE §105.43 HERCULES
4 LT245/75R17110 $131.25 GENERAL NOBID NOBID $153.26 BF GOODRICH $120.58 FIRESTONE $130.00 GOODYEAR $125.00 FIRESTONE $134.25 HERCULES
5 LT265/70R17/10 $142.14 GENERAL NO BID NOBID §162.74 BF GOODRICH $142.88 FIRESTONE $135.00 GOODYEAR $139.00 FIRESTONE $134.40 HERCULES
[ 195/60R15 $60.10 GENERAL NOBID NO BID $59.25 BF GOODRICH $66.04 FIRESTONE $60.41 GOODYEAR $§57.00 FIRESTONE $49.75 HERCULES
7 P235/75/IR17 §118.23 GENERAL NOBID NO BID $13095 MICHELIN $114.62 FIRESTONE $134.52 GOODYEAR $112.00 FIRESTONE §137.40 COQPER
] LT226/75/R17 NOBID NO BID NOBID NO BID §123.63 HANKOOK $118.69 FIRESTONE NOBID NO BID $112.00 FIRESTONE $155.00 COOPER
9 P235T0R17 $86.81 GENERAL NOBID NOBID $140.00 HANKOOK $106.02 FIRESTONE $133.24 GOODYEAR $106.00 FIRESTONE §121.80 HERCULES
10 P235(75/R16 $86.06 GENERAL NO BID NOBID $110.00 HANKOOK $108.43 FIRESTONE $118.46 GOODYEAR $106.00 FIRESTONE §114.50 COOPER
1" 205/70/R15 $61.84 GENERAL NO BID NOBID §70.00 HANKOOK §64.21 FIRESTONE $58.77 GOODYEAR $58.00 FIRESTONE $62.00 HERCULES
12 LT24570/R17 $118.21 GENERAL NO BID NOBID $135.09 BF GOODRICH $125.97 FIRESTONE $125.00 GOODYEAR §122.00 FIRESTONE $105.00 HERCULES
13 LT225(75/R171101116-AT $182.48 COOPER NOBID NOBID $150.89 BF GOODRICH $118.69 FIRESTONE NO BID NOBID $115.00 FIRESTONE §179.25 COOPER
14 225/65/R17 $91.52 GENERAL NOBID NO BID §72.25 HANKOOK 568.24 FIRESTONE $76.00 GOODYEAR $85.00 FIRESTONE $82.40 HERCULES
15 225/65/R17 $91.52 GENERAL NOBID NOBID §72.25 HANKOOK $158.46 FIRESTONE $106.45 GOODYEAR $85.00 FIRESTONE $82.40 HERCULES
16 P225/50R17 $92.75 GENERAL NOBID NOBID $§97.96 BF GOODRICH $90.08 FIRESTONE $77.00 GOODYEAR $92.00 FIRESTONE §75.80 HERCULES
Goup 4: Pursuit Tires

1 245-55R18 103W §118.42 GENERAL NOBID NOBID §130.35 BF GOODRICH $130.84 FIRESTONE $140.00 GOODYEAR §127.00 FIRESTONE $121.95 BF GOODRICH
2 P265/60R17 108V $112.91 GENERAL NOBID NO BID $143.60 BF GOODRICH $124.40 FIRESTONE $115.00 GOODYEAR $122.00 FIRESTONE $115.95 BF GOODRICH
3 235/56R17 5§100.96 GENERAL NOBID NO BID $90.85 BF GOODRICH $111.70 FIRESTONE $104.00 GOODYEAR $100.00 FIRESTONE $90.80 BF GOODRICH
4 P225/60R16 97V $87.18 GENERAL NOBID NOBID §84.53 BF GOODRICH $97.85 FIRESTONE $90.00 GOODYEAR $95.00 FIRESTONE $84.50 BF GOODRICH




Bid 20-006

Tires for the County of El Paso
Opening Date: Thursday December 12, 2019

American Tire Distributors Border Parts Group, Inc. Bori::;::z [:i".rﬁ:m' Broadway Motors e Goodgi:::;?& Rubber Southern Tire Mart, LLC Tire Connection
Fort Worth, TX dba NAPA ElPaso. TX dba Bill Williams Tires Akron. OH Columbia, MS El Paso, TX
El Paso, TX : El Paso, TX ;
Unit Price Manufacture | Unit Price Manufaclure Unit Price Manufacture Unit Price Manufacture Unit Price Manufaclure Unit Price Manufacture Unit Price Manufacture
Group 5: Mowers | Utility Tractos | Utility Vehicles
1 19X10.5-8 $62.73 CARLISLE NO BID NOBID $40.00 HERCULES NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID NO BID NO BID NOBID NOBID
2 18%9.50-8 $37.59 CARLISLE NO BID NOBID §38.23 NAN KANG $60.00 BKT NOBID NOBID $25.00 OTR ENGINEER §38.70 HERCULES
3 23X10.50-8 $74.50 CARLISLE NO BID NOBID NO BID NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID NO BID $84.40 PREM
4 20X12.00-10 $65.94 CARLISLE NO BID NOBID $62.50 CARLISLE §71.00 CARLISLE NO BID NOBID $70.00 CARLISLE $67.90 CARLISLE
5 26.5X14.00-12 $157.47 CARLISLE NOBID NOBID 5164.10 CARLISLE $167.00 CARLISLE NOBID NOBID $163.00 CARLISLE $149.96 CARLISLE
6 2219.50-10 §67.40 CARLISLE NO BID NO BID $67.18 CARLISLE §71.00 CARLISLE NOBID NOBID $68.00 CARLISLE $75.95 CARLISLE
7 13X5.00-6 $18.06 CARLISLE NOBID NOBID $17.75 NAN KANG $29.50 CARLISLE NO BID NO BID $19.00 CARLISLE $18.58 CARLISLE
8 21X11.008 §87.43 CARLISLE NO BID NO BID §65.00 CARLISLE $78.40 CARLISLE NO BID NOBID $70.00 CARLISLE §72.99 CARLISLE
9 20X10.00-10 $49.38 CARLISLE NO BID NO BID $48.75 NAN KANG $80.80 CARLISLE NOBID NO BID $29.00 OTR ENGINEER $50.82 HERCULES
10 24X13.00-12 $130.97 CARLISLE NO BID NO BID $128.40 CARLISLE $157.00 CARLISLE NO BID NOBID $135.00 CARLISLE $133.52 CARLISLE
1" 24X12-10 $86.60 CARLISLE NOBID NO BID $76.50 CARLISLE $97.60 CARLISLE NOBID NO BID $112.00 CARLISLE $89.10 CARLISLE
12 23X11.00-10 $77.40 CARLISLE NO BID NO BID $77.91 CARLISLE $95.20 CARLISLE NO BID NO BID $103.00 CARLISLE $99.80 CARLISLE
13 25X13-9 $98.49 CARLISLE NOBID NOBID §79.79 POWER KING $118.00 CARLISLE NOBID NO BID $107.00 CARLISLE §101.40 CARLISLE
14 22.5X10-8 $79.57 CARLISLE NOBID NOBID $68.50 CARLISLE $97.60 CARLISLE NOBID NOBID §77.00 CARLISLE $81.90 CARLISLE
15 33X16 LL-16 NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID NO BID NO BID NOBID NOBID NOBID NO BID NO BID NOBID NOBID NO BID
16 22X10-14 $67.98 CARLISLE NOBID NOBID NO BID NO BID NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID $61.00 OTR ENGINEER §134.00 MOJAVE
17 11%4.00-5 s12.71 CARLISLE NOBID NOBID §15.49 NAN KANG $30.40 CARLISLE NOBID NOBID §10.00 HIRUN $24.00 CARLISLE
18 13X6.50-6 $23.07 CARLISLE NO BID NOBID §22.77 POWER KING $35.20 CARLISLE NOBID NOBID $26.00 CARLISLE $29.85 CARLISLE
19 26X12.00-12 $81.25 CARLISLE NOBID NO8ID §84.47 POWER KING $115.60 CARLISLE NOBID NO BID §105.00 CARLISLE §99.85 CARLISLE
20 4.10-350-4 $10.55 CARLISLE NOBID NO BID $15.20 NAN KANG $29.20 CARLISLE NOBID NOBID $21.00 CARLISLE $23.40 ‘CARLISLE
2 24X12.00-12 $83.81 CARLISLE NOBID NO BID §70.87 POWER KING $91.60 CARLISLE NOBID NOBID $99.00 CARLISLE $86.25 CARLISLE
22 24X9.50-10 $80.49 CARLISLE NOBID NOBID $69.95 CARLISLE $85.60 CARLISLE NOBID NOBID $96.00 CARLISLE $62.10 CARLISLE
23 24X10.50-10 $95.19 CARLISLE NOBID NQ BID $105.11 CARLISLE §114.40 CARLISLE NOBID NOBID $107.00 CARLISLE $97.98 CARLISLE
24 23X8.50-12 §71.32 CARLISLE NO BID NO BID $67.79 POWER KING $85.60 CARLISLE NO BID NOBID $38.00 GLADIATOR §73.40 CARLISLE
25 44X18.00-20 $298.22 CARLISLE NOBID NOBID $328.00 CARLISLE $349.60 CARLISLE NOBID NOBID NO BID NO BID §378.52 CARLISLE
NOTE: These vendors do not qualify for the Local Business Preference Policy,




Bid price must be for mounting each tire (if needed).

Bid 20-006
Tires for the County of El Paso
Opening Date: Thursday December 12, 2019

e Border Parts Group, Inc. Border Recapping LLC. Broadway Motors
A’""”ﬁi’r‘tm:;:s;"xm‘“ dba NAPA dba Border Tire dba Bill Williams Tires The:Goodyen ;r;:‘ 2‘:’“” Campeny, S"""(‘;I’L::i’;";'; tLs
! El Paso, TX El Paso, TX. El Paso, TX I !
Car L Buses | Other Car ek Buses Other Car Triedd Buses Other Car Truel] [ Buses Other Gar Trugh! Buses Other Car Trueld Buses Other
Van Van Van Van Van Van
For Listed
Mount and Oismount Labor NOBID NOBID NOBID NO BID §7.50 $10.00 $14.50 NO BID $10.00 $10.00 $20.00 $65.00 $12.00 $15.00 $30.00 $65.00 $15.00 $15.00 $30.00 $30.00 $8.00 $16.00 $15.00 RimSSi.:::eler
Computerized Spin Balance NOBID NO BID NOBID NOBID $5.00 §7.00 §12.50 NOBID $10.00 $10.00 $20.00 NOBID $15.00 $18.00 $35.00 NOBID $17.00 $17.00 $35.00 NO BID $10.00 $20.00 $20.00 /A
Tire Disposal Fee NOBID NO BID NOBID NOBID $3.00 $3.00 $3.00 NO BID §4.00 §7.00 §7.00 $40.00 §5.00 $8.00 $10.00 $45.00 $12.00 $12.00 $12.00 $12.00 $3.00 $8.00 $8.00 1[)(21.‘.
Tire Weight
AS AS AS AS
Shop Parts NO BID NO BID NOBID NOBID NO BID NO BID NOBID NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID SPEC. SPEC. SPEC. SPEC. $7.00 $7.00 §7.00 §7.00 $2.50 $2.50 $2.50 $5.00
Computerized Wheel Alignment NO BID NO BID NOBID NOBID $49.99 $49.99 $89.99 NOBID NO BID $99.00 $129.00 NOBID $89.00 $89.00 $109.00 NOBID NOBID  NOBID NOBID NOBID §35.00 | $95.00 $95.00 NiA
Cost for Mobile Unit $90.0/r. scheduled 24 hoursin a ad :
(for mouniing tires atlocation requested by NO BID NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID NO BID NOBID NO BID $45.00 $65.00 $75.00 $65.00 $65.00 $65.00 $85.00 $125.00/ non-schedulad $45.00 $45.00 $45.00 $60.00
Fix or Repalr Flat Tires NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID $6.75 $10.50 $12.75 NOBID $10.00 $10.00 $25.00 $65.00 $15.00 $20.00 $35.00 $85.00 §20.00 [ 520.00 | $40.00 | $40.00 $20.00 $25.00 $25.00 RImsg.izfl:eter
Tire Connection
El Paso, TX
Car Teick! Buses Other
Van
Mount and Dismount Labor $8.75 $8.76 NOBID NOBID
Computerized Spin Balance $10.00 $10.00 NOBID NOBID
Tire Disposal Fee §2.75 $2.75 NO BID NOBID
Shop.Parts NO BID NOBID NOBID NOBID
Computerized Wheel Alignment $59.00 $59.00 NO BID NOBID
Cost for Mobile Unit
for mounting tires at location requested by hOBID NO:BIE NoBD NOEID
Fix or Repair Flat Tires $16.00 $16.00 NOBID NOBID
" : S PDeTD —) - AR
" == )
Approyed By (Signature) Approved By (Print)
\_Qp/~ G . 2S-29 L
‘ c& :
Recommenagtion Date BG12/20/2019



EL PASO COUNTY FLEET OPERATIONS DIRECTOR
500 E. SAN ANTONIO STE 302
EL PASO, TEXAS 79901
(915) 546-2057
FAX: (915) 543-3888

Memorandum
To: Mrs. Debra Carrejo-Trull, Purchasing Agent
From: Hopeton Staple, Fleet Operations Director

Date: March 27, 2020

Re: Bid 20-006 Tires for the County of El Paso.

1. Ms. Carrejo-Trull based on our specifications and overall pricing on bid 20-006 Automotive, Truck
and Equipment Tires, | am recommending vendors as highlighted on the attached spreadsheet for
tires in group #1 (Automobile), group 2# (Off Road Tires-Heavy Duty Tires), group 3# (Trucks/ Vans/
Buses) and group #4 (Pursuit Tires).

2. Based on the same criteria and specifications, no vendor met the specifications for tires in group
#5 (Mowers/ Utility Tractors/ Utility Vehicles). We will follow the normal procurement guidelines for
tires in this group.

Thanks.

FHopetan R. Staple

El Paso County Fleet Operations Director
500 E. San Antonio, Suite 302

El Paso, TX 79901

Phone (915) 546-2057

Fax (915)546-2217
hstaple@epcounty.com



mailto:hstaple@epcounty.com

Vendors Receiving Specifications

Bid #20-006, Tires for the County of El Paso
Opening Date: Thursday, December 5, 2019

Company Contact Address City State Zipcode Telephone Fax Addendums
Ato Z Tire Tom Plequette P.O. Box 9138 Amarillo TX 79105-913 806-373-2592  806-373-6504 1.2 3 4
Alamo Auto Supply Dick Karasne/John H 5923 Gateway West El Paso TX 79925 915-781-1234  915-781-0600 1.2 3 4
American Tire Distributor 12420 Mercantile El Paso X 79928 915.774.0256  915.772.4640 1.2 3 4
Am-Pac Tire Distributors Maria Gardea 12420 Mercantile Ave Ste C El Paso X 79928 915-774-0256 1.2 3 4
Auto Plus Richard McRae 5940 Paisano El Paso TX 79925 214.3308171  214.330.1741 1.2 3 4
AutoZone Manny Hernandez 1461 N. Lee Trevino El Paso TX 79936 915-590-5390 915-595-1635 1 2 3 4
Best Tire Service Edmundo Maese 8801 Dyer St. El Paso X 79904 915-757-3411  915-755-6229 1 2 3 4
Bill Williams Tire Company 1160 Horizon Socorro TX 79927 915-590-8473 1 2 3 4
BQL Car Care Center 4060 Bancroft El Paso TX 79902 915-892-1551 1 2 3 4
Brewer Terry Calhoun 2701 Candelaria NE Albuquerque NM 87107 575-524-8696 1 2 3 4
Bridgestone American Tire Operati 1025 Texas Ave El Paso TX 79901 915-532-5451 915-533-0569 1 2 3 4
C & M Discount Tires Juan Moreno 2100 Wedgewood El Paso X 79925 915-598-0315 1 2 3 4
C & R DISTRIBUTING INC. 140 S. PRADO ROAD EL PASO TX 79907-613 9158599271 9158580373 1.2 3 4
Darrington Tire Plant Kenneth McCollum 59 Darrington Rd. Rosharon X 77583 (281) 595-3465 (281) 595-3101 1 2 3 4
Discount Tire 6730 N. mesa El Paso TX 79912 915-584-7867 915-584-8520 1.2 3 4
Specs Mailed: Tuesday, November 12, 2019 Page 1 of 4




Vendors Receiving Specifications

Bid #20-006, Tires for the County of El Paso
Opening Date: Thursday, December 5, 2019

Company Contact Address City State Zipcode Telephone Fax Addendums
Forest Tire Company, Inc. 2305 Gateway Blvd. South El Paso TX 79928 915-566-2639 1.2 3 4
Fusion 339 Moon Road El Paso TX 79927 915-999-7528 1.2 3 4
GCR Tires & Service Efrain 1025 Texas Ave. El Paso TX 79901 915-532-5451  915-533-0569 1.2 3 4
Grays Wholesale Tire Roger Webster PO Box 2561 Fort Worth X 76113 800-792-8749 817-877-5018 1.2 3 4
GVMI, INC. 7738 Gateway Blvd. El Paso TX 79915 915-591-1900 1.2 3 4
HomeDepot 7545 N. Mesa El Paso TX 79912 915-217-8071 1.2 3 4
Industrial Tire Company 8411 Lockheed Ste 1 El Paso TX 79925 915-540-7400 1 2 3 4
JG Auto Works 420 E. Paisano Dr. El Paso TX 79901 915-545-2300 1.2 3 4
John Deere Company Joey Sanchez PO Box 140 Tornillo X 79853 915-764-2263 915-764-2956 1 2 3 4
Lube-Tune Rick Parra/Jaime Pa 5330 N. Mesa #121 El Paso TX 79912 915-581-1031 915-581-5084 1.2 3 4
M.J. Mader Enterprises Inc. dba Bi 1315 West Main Dr. El Paso TX 79902 915-288-5424 915-888-214-42 1 2 3 4
Martin Tire Company Ronald A. Martin 1341 Lee Trevino El Paso X 79936 915-592-6496 915-592-6263 1 2 3 4
MHC Kenworth Rick Kenly 10901 Gateway West El Paso X 79935 800.351.2285 915.591.6261 1 2 3 4
Napa Center El Paso Janette Jones 7750 Gateway E. El Paso X 79915 915-591-1900 915-621-6405 1 2 3 4
Omnisource United P.O. Box 9138 Amarillo X 79105 806-373-2592 (806) 373-6504 1 2 3 4
Specs Mailed: Tuesday, November 12, 2019 Page 2 of 4




Vendors Receiving Specifications

Bid #20-006, Tires for the County of El Paso
Opening Date: Thursday, December 5, 2019

Company Contact Address City State Zipcode Telephone Fax Addendums
O'Reilly Auto Parts PO Box 9464 Springfield MO 65801-946 9155332989 9155448534 1.2 3 4
Pep Boys Freddy Vargas 1910 George Dieter Dr. El Paso TX 79936 915.5695.0322  915.598.4239 1.2 3 4
Pep Boys (Gateway) Carlos Escobar 10501 Gateway West El Paso TX 79925 915-449-5491  915-598-4239 1 2 3 4
Redburn Tire Company Frank Tellez 2023 Appaloosa Sunland Park  NM 88063 505-589-1100 505-589-4233 1.2 3 4
Rise V Auto & Tire Center Letty Chavira 1685 Joe Battle Blvd El Paso X 79936 915-855-7373  915-855-4121 1.2 3 4
Rise V Auto & Tire Center Letty Chavira 1685 Joe Battle Blvd El Paso TX 79936 915-855-7373  915-855-4121 1 2 3 4
SC Fuels 10925 Marconi Lane El Paso TX 79935 800-465-4200 915-532-3488 1.2 3 4
Solideal Tire Inc. 11405 Rojas Dr. Ste. 13 &14 El Paso TX 79936 915-594-1661 915-594-1675 1.2 3 4
Southern Tire Mart, LLC Bobby R. Harms 5051 Sharp Street Dallas TX 75247 877-786-4681 214-389-7111 1 2 3 4
TCI Tire Centers Francisco Martinez 12130 Esther Lama, Ste. 100 El Paso TX 79936 915-858-5824 915-860-2365 1 2 3 4
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Com Gerald F Payne 1459 Bessemer El Paso X 79936 915-599-1400 915-590-4241 1 2 3 4
Tigua Transportation Incorporated 1025 Wall Street El Paso X 79915 915-775-1945 1 2 3 4
Tire Center, LLC Robert Murguia 12130 Easther Lama, Suite #100 El Paso TX 79936 915.858.5824 915.860.2365 1 2 3 4
Tire Connection 12010 New World El Paso X 79936 915-855-3003 915-833-3363 1.2 3 4
Tire Pros #15 Greg Martinez/ Jaim 1101 E. Missouri El Paso X 79902 915-533-6231 915-542-2631 1 2 3 4
Specs Mailed: Tuesday, November 12, 2019 Page 3 of 4




Vendors Receiving Specifications

Bid #20-006, Tires for the County of El Paso
Opening Date: Thursday, December 5, 2019

Company Contact Address City State Zipcode Telephone Fax Addendums

Tops Tire & Wheel 1100 Texas Avenue El Paso TX 79901 915-544-6008 1.2 3 4

Wicker Tire Co. 701 W. Paisano Dr. El Paso X 79901 915-532-2615  915-532-0133 1.2 3 4
Page 4 of 4
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County of El Paso Purchasing Department
800 E. Overland, Room 300
El Paso, Texas 79901
(915) 546-2048 / Fax: (915) 546-8180

MEMORANDOM
To: All Interested Vendors
From: El Paso County Purchasing Department

Date: June 23, 2020

Subject: Bid 20-006 Tires for the County of El Paso

Thank you for taking the time and responding on the above mentioned Bid. We
realize that your time and resources are valuable and we appreciate you taking
the time to respond to this solicitation. The Purchasing Department will be
presenting this solicitation to Commissioners Court meeting on Monday, June
29, 2020 to award this solicitation.

The recommendations and justification will be posted on the Commissioners
Court Agenda three (3) days prior to the meeting. To access the Agenda on our
website, go to www.epcounty.com; County Meetings; Regular Meeting Agendas;
select the HTML file that corresponds with the meeting date as shown in the
above paragraph.

If you would like to attend the proceedings, Court is held at 9:30 a.m. on the 3
floor of the County Courthouse, room 303, 500 E. San Antonio Avenue, El Paso,
Texas or you can view the meeting on our website at www.epcounty.com,
click on streaming videos, select live meeting. If you need to address the court
reference this bid you may do so when it comes up for discussion during the
Regular Agenda items. This is only informing the participating vendors who
submitted a response. And again thank you for your time.


http://www.epcounty.com/
http://www.epcounty.com/
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